
The Bethel History 
Project

The story of Bethel AME is a 
collection of the stories of 
thousands of members who have 
called it home.  We have a rich 
and diverse history, and the 
Bethel History Project is an 
opportunity for us to share our 
story in oral and written form.  


Bethel AME Church is 
collaborating with Publishing 
Concepts, Inc. (PCI), to create an 
oral and written history of Bethel 
AME Church that will record our 
shared connections.  Beginning in 
the next 90 days, we will be 
inviting our current and former 
members to share their Bethel 
stories for a book that will 

preserve the rich history of our 
beloved church, as told by those 
who have lived it. Don’t miss this 
opportunity to tell your Bethel 
AME story, capture memories, 
and to celebrate our rich history.


The collection of stories will be 
available for purchase from PCI.  
While there is a fee to purchase 
the printed book, you do not need 
to purchase the book to 
contribute your story. 


Use the link or QR code below to 
update or provide your contact 
information to ensure you are 
included in the Bethel History 
Project.


Rev. Patrick D. Clayborn, Ph.D., Senior Pastor 
Website: https://www.bethel1.org Email: info@bethel1.org

https://bit.ly/BethelHistoryProject
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